
   

                          Board of Park Commissioners 
                                    Approval Form 

 
PROJECT NAME: Botanical Conservatory Catering Fees – Event Center LLC 
 

Project Narrative: 

A vendor agreement was entered on behalf of the Board of Park Commissioners with Event Center LLC 
dba Empyrean Events & Catering on April 25, 2019.  Event Center LLC dba Empyrean Events & Catering 
served as a client vendor for an event that took place at the Botanical Conservatory on August 28, 2021, 
for which they owed $350 in catering fees per the agreement. 

The Fort Wayne Parks & Recreation Department’s Botanical Conservatory has made every possible 
effort to collect on the balance past due by Events Center LLC dba Empyrean Events & Catering.  The 
company has ceased operations and has been unresponsive in our effort to collect.  On December 16, 
2021 Snow & Sauerteig, LLP, the collections agency utilized by the City of Fort Wayne, declined to 
pursue the balance because Event Center LLC dba Empyrean Events & Catering has ceased operations.  
Their catering agreement has been terminated for cause. 

Board Approval: 

At this time, I would like to request approval for a balance write-off with Event Center LLC dba 
Empyrean Events & Catering at a total balance of $350.00, impacted revenue fund 121P270. 

_____________________________________________________________________________________ 

The Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation and the Board of Park Commissioners, met to host their regularly 
scheduled monthly Board meeting on February 17, 2022, to approve a write-off for the above 
referenced agreement, in the amount of $350.00 

We, the Board of Park Commissioners, on the date stated do ATTEST, and sign to the above referenced and 
attached documents, and approve as presented. 

 

____________________________________       _________________________________ 
William Zielke, Commissioner         Justin Shurley, Commissioner 
 
 
____________________________________      __________________________________ 
Cory Miller, Commissioner        Rick Briley, Commissioner 



















Invoice No. 1031202101

Name Date 10/31/2021

Address Order No.

City Fort Wayne IN ZIP 46802 Rep

Phone FOB

Qty Unit Price TOTAL

1 $350.00 $350.00

SubTotal  $350.00

Shipping & Handling  $0.00

  Cash Taxes  

  Check

  Credit Card TOTAL  $350.00

Name

CC #

Expires

Office Use Only

Description

Evening Rental Catering Fees

     08.28.2021 - Maryam Noureldin

Empyrean Events & Catering

110 West Berry Street, Suite 2500 & 2600

(260) 444-4688

Foellinger-Freimann Botanical 
Conservatory
1100 S. Calhoun Street
Fort Wayne, IN  46802
260/427-6440 fax 260/427-6450

INVOICE

Payment Details

Customer
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Nathaniel Cardelli

From: Kim Vachon <kim@snowsauerteig.com>
Sent: Thursday, December 16, 2021 4:06 PM
To: Nathaniel Cardelli
Subject: RE: Empyrean Events - Unpaid Account - City of Fort Wayne

Hi! 
 
I had Mr. Sauerteig review your email and unfortunately he has elected to decline an attempt to pursue this outstanding 
invoice since the company has ceased operations.  
 
Thank you so much for your email and if there is anything we can help you with in the future please do not hesitate to 
reach out to us. 
 
Have a blessed holiday, 
 
Kim Vachon 
Collection Supervisor 

 
203 E Berry Street 1100 
Fort Wayne, IN 46802 
(260) 969‐3255 ext. 123 tel 
(260) 969‐1279 fax 
www.snowsauerteig.com 
Confidentiality Notice: If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you 
are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, 
please immediately notify us by telephone, and return the original message to us at the above address via the United States Postal Service. 
  
IRS Circular 230 Disclosure: Pursuant to Internal Revenue Service Circular 230, we are required to advise you that if there is any tax advice contained herein, it is 
not intended to be used, and cannot be used, by the addressee or any taxpayer, for the purpose of avoiding penalties that may be imposed under the Internal 
Revenue Code 
 
Email Opt-Out Notice: You may opt out of receiving further email communications from Snow & Sauerteig LLP to this email address by replying with an email 
message that states “STOP.”  

 
 
 
 

From: Nathaniel Cardelli <Nathaniel.Cardelli@cityoffortwayne.org>  
Sent: Thursday, December 16, 2021 11:37 AM 
To: Kim Vachon <kim@snowsauerteig.com> 
Subject: Empyrean Events ‐ Unpaid Account ‐ City of Fort Wayne 
 
Kim, hi! 
 
I’m writing from the Fort Wayne Parks & Recreation Department’s Botanical Conservatory in an effort to collect on a 
balance past due by Events Center LLC dba Empyrean Events & Catering.  I’ve attached their catering contract, past due 
invoice, and correspondence wherein the invoice was sent below.  We do know that they have ceased operations and 
they have been unresponsive to us in our effort to collect.  Their contract has been voided.  We would like to send them 
to collections now, please let me know if this is doable – thanks! 
 
Their most recent contact information is below 
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Cell:  
260.494.9495 ‐ Jeremy 
260.494.8764 ‐ Renee 
 
Business Phone: 
260.444.4688 
 
Emails: 
jeremy@empyreaneventsfw.com 
info@empyreaneventsfw.com 
alex@empyreaneventsfw.com 
renee@empyreaneventsfw.com 
renee@reneeminer.com 
misty@empyreaneventsfw.com 
 
Address 
400 W Main St, Fort Wayne, IN 46802 
 
Warmly, 
 

Nathaniel T. Cardelli 
SALES OPERATIONS SUPERVISOR 
Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation 
 

(260) 427-6444 (Office) | (260) 427-6440 (Main) 
Foellinger-Freimann Botanical Conservatory 
1100 South Calhoun Street | Fort Wayne, Indiana 46802 
 

      
 
 
From: Nathaniel Cardelli  
Sent: Sunday, October 31, 2021 11:54 AM 
To: info@empyreaneventsfw.com; Alex <alexandra@empyreaneventsfw.com> 
Subject: 08.28.2021 ‐ Catering Fee Invoice 
 
See attached! 
 
Warmly, 
 

Nathaniel T. Cardelli 
SALES OPERATIONS SUPERVISOR 
Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation 
 

(260) 427-6444 (Office) | (260) 427-6440 (Main) 
Foellinger-Freimann Botanical Conservatory 
1100 South Calhoun Street | Fort Wayne, Indiana 46802 
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