Board of Park Commissioners
Approval Form

2022 Parks Paving Project
Various Parks

Project: 2022001

Quest Number: 8092802

Project Approval Request

Scope of Work:

Work includes but is not limited to site demolition, excavation, drainage, milling, paving,
striping, sign installation, erosion control measures and seeding to various parks parking
lots, drives and trails as specified per drawings and specifications.

At Franke Park, we will be concentrating on the entrance to the park and the seal coating
of the Zoo Parking lot at the Zoo main entrance. At Kreager Park, we are concentrating
the work at the turn around next to Taylors Dream and a walk path that located next to
the outdoor fitness equipment. At the Downtown Community Center, we will
concentrate the work in the main parking lot behind the building. At Swinney Park we
will concentrate our work on the trail from the Frisbee golf parking lot moving north into
the park, and in Hamilton Park, we will be taking care of areas where the edge of the path
is deteriorating on the east side of the park.

Quotes were received on behalf of the Board of Park Commissioners on January 28th, 2022.
There were four bids and T. E. Inc. was the lowest bidder

Board Approval:
At this time, I would like to request approval for a contract with T. E. Inc. at a total cost of
$198,300.00 with the funding to come out of the Parks Cumulative Capital Funds.

The Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation and the Board of Park Commissioners, met to host their
regularly scheduled monthly Board meeting on February 17, 2022, to approve the above
referenced project and contract, in the amount of $198,300.00

We The Board of Park Commissioners, on the date stated do ATTEST, and sign to the above referenced
and attached documents, and approve as presented.

William Zielke, Commissioner Justin Shurley, Commissioner

Cory Miller, Commissioner Rick Briley, Commissioner



Bid/Quote Tabulation

Project Name: 2022 Parks Paving Projects

Project No.: 2022001
Quest vBid #: 8092802
Bids Due: 01/28/2022

CONTRACTOR: Brooks Construction T-E Inc. Wayne Asphalt E&B Paving Inc. API Construction
Base bid: $205,929.00 $168,000.00 $180,997.00 No Bid Submitted $269,117.00
Alternate #1: . )

$13,000.00 $19,000.00 $19,000.00 No Bid Submitted $22,600.00
Foster West Seal Coat
Alter.nate #2: . $38,319.00 $19,500.00 $23,000.00 No Bid Submitted $25,200.00
McMillen Park Trail
Alternate #3:

$12,700.00 $14,350.00 $18,000.00 No Bid Submitted $19,900.00
Franke Park - Zoo Seal Coat
Alternate #4: _ $27,704.00 $15,950.00 $12,000.00 No Bid Submitted $14,000.00
Hamilton Park - Trail
Total: $246,333.00 $198,300.00 $210,997.00 N/A $303,017.00













Board of Park Commissioners
Approval Form
Various Court Improvements
Tennis and Pickle Ball Court Resurfacing Improvements

Project: 2022002
Quest Number: 8100821

Project Approval Request

Scope of Work:

Work includes court renovations at Lakeside, Hamilton, Foster, Kettler, and Tillman
tennis courts. Work shall include documenting existing court conditions including
dimensions, repair, fill seal and make smooth cracks and imperfections in the playing
surfaces. Remove selected tennis court net-posts and install new chain-link barrier
fencing per drawings. Prep and install new pickle ball posts including nets per drawings,
and prep all court areas to receive a 2-tone tennis & pickle ball court surface per drawings
provided by the Parks Department projects team.

Quotes were received on behalf of the Board of Park Commissioners on January 27th, 2022. Two
bids were received for this project and K&M Asphalt Sealing Maintenance Inc., is the lowest
bidder.

Board Approval:

At this time, I would like to request approval for a contract with K&M Asphalt Sealing
Maintenance Inc. at a total cost of $180,881.00, with the funding to come out of the Parks
Cumulative Capital Funds.

The Fort Wayne Parks and Recreation and the Board of Park Commissioners, met to host their
regularly scheduled monthly Board meeting on February 17, 2022, to approve the above
referenced project and contract, in the amount of $180,881.00.

We The Board of Park Commissioners, on the date stated do ATTEST, and sign to the above referenced
and attached documents, and approve as presented.

William Zielke, Commissioner Justin Shurley, Commissioner

Cory Miller, Commissioner Rick Briley, Commissioner



Bid Tabulation

Project Name: Tennis & Pickleball Court Resurfacing Improvements
Project No.: 2022002

Quest #8100821

Bids Due: 01/27/2022

CONTRACTOR: K&M Asphalt Sealing
AG Sport Surfaces Maint. Inc.

Base bid: $143,594.64 $144,764.00

Alternate 1: $35,347.51 $32,117.00

(Kettler Tennis court renovations )

Alternate 2:

. ] . $2,100.00 $4,000.00
(Tillman Pickleball court striping)
Base +Alt-1+Alt-2 $181,042.15 $180,881.00
Base +Alt-1 $178,942.15 $176,881.00

Base +Alt-2 $145,694.64 $148,764.00
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